
Audit of accounts of certain persons carrying on business or profession.

44AB. Every person,—

(a) carrying on business shall, if his total sales, turnover or gross receipts, as the case may be, in business exceed or exceeds one crore
rupees in any previous year :

Provided that in the case of a person whose—

(a) aggregate of all amounts received including amount received for sales, turnover or gross receipts during the previous year, in cash,
does not exceed five per cent of the said amount; and

(b) aggregate of all payments made including amount incurred for expenditure, in cash, during the previous year does not exceed five
per cent of the said payment,

this clause shall have effect as if for the words "one crore rupees", the words" [ten] crore rupees" had been substituted:

[Provided further that for the purposes of this clause, the payment or receipt, as the case may be, by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the payment or receipt, as the case may be, in cash; or]

(b) carrying on profession shall, if his gross receipts in profession exceed fifty lakh rupees in any previous year; or

(c) carrying on the business shall, if the profits and gains from the business are deemed to be the profits and gains of such person under
section 44AE or section 44BB or section 44BBB, as the case may be, and he has claimed his income to be lower than the profits or gains
so deemed to be the profits and gains of his business, as the case may be, in any previous year; or

(d) carrying on the profession shall, if the profits and gains from the profession are deemed to be the profits and gains of such person
under section 44ADA and he has claimed such income to be lower than the profits and gains so deemed to be the profits and gains of
his profession and his income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax in any previous year; or

(e) carrying on the business shall, if the provisions of sub-section (4) of section 44AD are applicable in his case and his income exceeds
the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax in any previous year,

get his accounts of such previous year audited by an accountant before the specified date and furnish by that date the report of such
audit in the prescribed form duly signed and verified by such accountant and setting forth such particulars as may be prescribed :

Provided that this section shall not apply to the person, who declares profits and gains for the previous year in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1) of section 44AD and his total sales, turnover or gross receipts, as the case may be, in business does not
exceed two crore rupees in such previous year:

Following first proviso shall be substituted for the existing first proviso to section 44AB by the Finance Act, 2023, w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that this section shall not apply to a person, who declares profits and gains for the previous year in accordance with the provisions of
sub-section (1) of section 44AD or sub-section (1) of section 44ADA:

Provided further that this section shall not apply to the person, who derives income of the nature referred to in section 44B or section
44BBA, on and from the 1st day of April, 1985 or, as the case may be, the date on which the relevant section came into force, whichever is
later :

Provided also that in a case where such person is required by or under any other law to get his accounts audited, it shall be sufficient
compliance with the provisions of this section if such person gets the accounts of such business or profession audited under such law
before the specified date and furnishes by that date the report of the audit as required under such other law and a further report by an
accountant in the form prescribed under this section.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(i) "accountant" shall have the same meaning as in the Explanation below sub-section (2) of section 288;

(ii) "specified date", in relation to the accounts of the assessee of the previous year relevant to an assessment year, means date one
month prior to the due date for furnishing the return of income under sub-section (1) of section 139.

72

73

74

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 
72. See rule 6G. Prescribed audit reports are as under:—
  (i) Audit report in case of person who carries on business or profession and who is required to get his accounts audited under any other law: Form 3CA 
(ii) Audit report in case of person who carries on business or profession and who is not required to get his accounts audited under any other law: Form 3CB
(iii) Prescribed particulars in case of (i) and (ii) above: Form 3CD.
Under proviso to rule 12(2) audit report shall be furnished electronically.

73. Substituted for "five" by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

74. Inserted by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

Special provision for computing profits and gains of business of plying, hiring or leasing goods carriages.

44AE. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43C, in the case of an assessee, who owns not more than
ten goods carriages at any time during the previous year and who is engaged in the business of plying, hiring or leasing such goods
carriages, the income of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" shall be deemed
to be the aggregate of the profits and gains, from all the goods carriages owned by him in the previous year, computed in accordance
with the provisions of sub-section (2).

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the profits and gains from each goods carriage,—

(i) being a heavy goods vehicle, shall be an amount equal to one thousand rupees per ton of gross vehicle weight or unladen weight, as
the case may be, for every month or part of a month during which the heavy goods vehicle is owned by the assessee in the previous year
or an amount claimed to have been actually earned from such vehicle, whichever is higher;

(ii) other than heavy goods vehicle, shall be an amount equal to seven thousand five hundred rupees for every month or part of a month
during which the goods carriage is owned by the assessee in the previous year or an amount claimed to have been actually earned from
such goods carriage, whichever is higher.

(3) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed :

Provided that where the assessee is a firm, the salary and interest paid to its partners shall be deducted from the income computed
under sub-section (1) subject to the conditions and limits specified in clause (b) of section 40.

(4) The written down value of any asset used for the purpose of the business referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed to have been
calculated as if the assessee had claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the
relevant assessment years.

(5) The provisions of sections 44AA and 44AB shall not apply in so far as they relate to the business referred to in sub-section (1) and in
computing the monetary limits under those sections, the gross receipts or, as the case may be, the income from the said business shall
be excluded.

(6) Nothing contained in the foregoing provisions of this section shall apply, where the assessee claims and produces evidence to prove
that the profits and gains from the aforesaid business during the previous year relevant to the assessment year commencing on the 1st
day of April, 1997 or any earlier assessment year, are lower than the profits and gains specified in sub-sections (1) and (2), and thereupon
the Assessing Officer shall proceed to make an assessment of the total income or loss of the assessee and determine the sum payable
by the assessee on the basis of assessment made under sub-section (3) of section 143.

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an assessee may claim lower profits and gains than
the profits and gains specified in sub-sections (1) and (2), if he keeps and maintains such books of account and other documents as
required under sub-section (2) of section 44AA and gets his accounts audited and furnishes a report of such audit as required under
section 44AB.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) the expressions "goods carriage", "gross vehicle weight" and "unladen weight" shall have the respective meanings assigned to them
in section 2 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (59 of 1988);

(aa) the expression "heavy goods vehicle" means any goods carriage, the gross vehicle weight of which exceeds 12000 kilograms;

(b) an assessee, who is in possession of a goods carriage, whether taken on hire purchase or on instalments and for which the whole or
part of the amount payable is still due, shall be deemed to be the owner of such goods carriage.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains in connection with the business of exploration, etc., of mineral oils.

44BB. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 41 and sections 43 and 43A, in the case of an assessee ,
being a non-resident, engaged in the business of providing services or facilities in connection with, or supplying plant and machinery on
hire used, or to be used, in the prospecting for, or extraction or production of, mineral oils, a sum equal to ten per cent of the aggregate
of the amounts specified in sub-section (2) shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the
head "Profits and gains of business or profession" :

Provided that this sub-section shall not apply in a case where the provisions of section 42 or section 44D or section 44DA or section 115A
or section 293A apply for the purposes of computing profits or gains or any other income referred to in those sections.

(2) The amounts referred to in sub-section (1) shall be the following, namely :—

(a) the amount paid or payable (whether in or out of India) to the assessee or to any person on his behalf on account of the provision of
services and facilities in connection with, or supply of plant and machinery on hire used, or to be used, in the prospecting for, or
extraction or production of, mineral oils in India; and

(b) the amount received or deemed to be received in India by or on behalf of the assessee on account of the provision of services and
facilities in connection with, or supply of plant and machinery on hire used, or to be used, in the prospecting for, or extraction or
production of, mineral oils outside India.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), an assessee may claim lower profits and gains than the profits and gains
specified in that sub-section, if he keeps and maintains such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section (2) of
section 44AA and gets his accounts audited and furnishes a report of such audit as required under section 44AB, and thereupon the
Assessing Officer shall proceed to make an assessment of the total income or loss of the assessee under sub-section (3) of section 143
and determine the sum payable by, or refundable to, the assessee.

Following sub-section (4) shall be inserted after sub-section (3) of section 44BB by the Finance Act, 2023, w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2) of section 32 and sub-section (1) of section 72, where an assessee declares profits and
gains of business for any previous year in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1), no set off of unabsorbed depreciation and brought
forward loss shall be allowed to the assessee for such previous year.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(i) "plant" includes ships, aircraft, vehicles, drilling units, scientific apparatus and equipment, used for the purposes of the said business;

(ii) "mineral oil" includes petroleum and natural gas.

Special provision for computing profits and gains of foreign companies engaged in the business of civil construction, etc., in
certain turnkey power projects.

44BBB. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 44AA, in the case of an assessee, being a foreign
company, engaged in the business of civil construction or the business of erection of plant or machinery or testing or commissioning
thereof, in connection with a turnkey power project approved by the Central Government in this behalf, a sum equal to ten per cent of
the amount paid or payable (whether in or out of India) to the said assessee or to any person on his behalf on account of such civil
construction, erection, testing or commissioning shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under
the head "Profits and gains of business or profession".

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), an assessee may claim lower profits and gains than the profits and gains
specified in that sub-section, if he keeps and maintains such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section (2) of
section 44AA and gets his accounts audited and furnishes a report of such audit as required under section 44AB, and thereupon the
Assessing Officer shall proceed to make an assessment of the total income or loss of the assessee under sub-section (3) of section 143
and determine the sum payable by, or refundable to, the assessee.

Following sub-section (3) shall be inserted after sub-section (2) of section 44BBB by the Finance Act, 2023, w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2) of section 32 and sub-section (1) of section 72, where an assessee declares profits and
gains of business for any previous year in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1), no set off of unabsorbed depreciation and brought
forward loss shall be allowed to the assessee for such previous year.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains of profession on presumptive basis.

44ADA. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 28 to 43C, [in case of an assessee, being an individual or a partnership firm
other than a limited liability partnership as defined under clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability Partnership Act,
2008 (6 of 2009), who is a resident in India, and] is engaged in a profession referred to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA and whose total
gross receipts do not exceed fifty lakh rupees in a previous year, a sum equal to fifty per cent of the total gross receipts of the assessee in
the previous year on account of such profession or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been
earned by the assessee, shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such profession chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and
gains of business or profession".

Following provisos shall be inserted after sub-section (1) of section 44ADA by the Finance Act, 2023, w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that in case of an assessee where the amount or aggregate of the amounts received during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed
five per cent of the total gross receipts of such previous year, this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "fifty lakh rupees", the words
"seventy-five lakh rupees" had been substituted:

Provided further that for the purposes of the first proviso, the receipt of amount or aggregate of amounts by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the receipt in cash.

(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.

(3) The written down value of any asset used for the purposes of profession shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the assessee
had claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant assessment years.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an assessee who claims that his profits and gains
from the profession are lower than the profits and gains specified in sub-section (1) and whose total income exceeds the maximum
amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be required to keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as
required under sub-section (1) of section 44AA and get them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.

 
76. Substituted for "in the case of an assessee, being a resident in India, who" by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

76

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains of business on presumptive basis.

44AD. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43C, in the case of an eligible assessee engaged in an
eligible business, a sum equal to eight per cent of the total turnover or gross receipts of the assessee in the previous year on account of
such business or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been earned by the eligible assessee, shall
be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" :

Provided that this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "eight per cent", the words "six per cent" had been substituted, in
respect of the amount of total turnover or gross receipts which is received by an account payee cheque or an account payee bank draft
or use of electronic clearing system through a bank account or through such other electronic mode as may be prescribed  during the
previous year or before the due date specified in sub-section (1) of section 139 in respect of that previous year.

(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.

(3) The written down value of any asset of an eligible business shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the eligible assessee had
claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant assessment years.

(4) Where an eligible assessee declares profit for any previous year in accordance with the provisions of this section and he declares
profit for any of the five assessment years relevant to the previous year succeeding such previous year not in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1), he shall not be eligible to claim the benefit of the provisions of this section for five assessment years
subsequent to the assessment year relevant to the previous year in which the profit has not been declared in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1).

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an eligible assessee to whom the provisions of sub-
section (4) are applicable and whose total income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be
required to keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section (2) of section 44AA and get
them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.

(6) The provisions of this section, notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions, shall not apply to—

(i) a person carrying on profession as referred to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA;

(ii) a person earning income in the nature of commission or brokerage; or

(iii) a person carrying on any agency business.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) "eligible assessee" means,—

(i) an individual, Hindu undivided family or a partnership firm, who is a resident, but not a limited liability partnership firm as defined
under clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability Partnership Act, 2008 (6 of 2009); and

(ii) who has not claimed deduction under any of the sections 10A, 10AA, 10B, 10BA or deduction under any provisions of Chapter VIA
under the heading "C.—Deductions in respect of certain incomes" in the relevant assessment year;

(b) "eligible business" means,—

(i) any business except the business of plying, hiring or leasing goods carriages referred to in section 44AE; and

(ii) whose total turnover or gross receipts in the previous year does not exceed an amount of two crore rupees.

Following provisos shall be inserted after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Explanation to section 44AD by the Finance Act, 2023,
w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that where the amount or aggregate of the amounts received during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed five per cent of the
total turnover or gross receipts of such previous year, this sub-clause shall have effect as if for the words "two crore rupees", the words "three
crore rupees" had been substituted:

Provided further that for the purposes of the first proviso, the receipt of amount or aggregate of amounts by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the receipt in cash.

75

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 
75. See rule 6ABBA.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains of business on presumptive basis.

44AD. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43C, in the case of an eligible assessee engaged in an
eligible business, a sum equal to eight per cent of the total turnover or gross receipts of the assessee in the previous year on account of
such business or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been earned by the eligible assessee, shall
be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" :

Provided that this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "eight per cent", the words "six per cent" had been substituted, in
respect of the amount of total turnover or gross receipts which is received by an account payee cheque or an account payee bank draft
or use of electronic clearing system through a bank account or through such other electronic mode as may be prescribed  during the
previous year or before the due date specified in sub-section (1) of section 139 in respect of that previous year.

(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.

(3) The written down value of any asset of an eligible business shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the eligible assessee had
claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant assessment years.

(4) Where an eligible assessee declares profit for any previous year in accordance with the provisions of this section and he declares
profit for any of the five assessment years relevant to the previous year succeeding such previous year not in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1), he shall not be eligible to claim the benefit of the provisions of this section for five assessment years
subsequent to the assessment year relevant to the previous year in which the profit has not been declared in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1).

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an eligible assessee to whom the provisions of sub-
section (4) are applicable and whose total income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be
required to keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section (2) of section 44AA and get
them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.

(6) The provisions of this section, notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions, shall not apply to—

(i) a person carrying on profession as referred to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA;

(ii) a person earning income in the nature of commission or brokerage; or

(iii) a person carrying on any agency business.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) "eligible assessee" means,—

(i) an individual, Hindu undivided family or a partnership firm, who is a resident, but not a limited liability partnership firm as defined
under clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability Partnership Act, 2008 (6 of 2009); and

(ii) who has not claimed deduction under any of the sections 10A, 10AA, 10B, 10BA or deduction under any provisions of Chapter VIA
under the heading "C.—Deductions in respect of certain incomes" in the relevant assessment year;

(b) "eligible business" means,—

(i) any business except the business of plying, hiring or leasing goods carriages referred to in section 44AE; and

(ii) whose total turnover or gross receipts in the previous year does not exceed an amount of two crore rupees.

Following provisos shall be inserted after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Explanation to section 44AD by the Finance Act, 2023,
w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that where the amount or aggregate of the amounts received during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed five per cent of the
total turnover or gross receipts of such previous year, this sub-clause shall have effect as if for the words "two crore rupees", the words "three
crore rupees" had been substituted:

Provided further that for the purposes of the first proviso, the receipt of amount or aggregate of amounts by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the receipt in cash.

75

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 
75. See rule 6ABBA.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains of business on presumptive basis.

44AD. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43C, in the case of an eligible assessee engaged in an
eligible business, a sum equal to eight per cent of the total turnover or gross receipts of the assessee in the previous year on account of
such business or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been earned by the eligible assessee, shall
be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" :

Provided that this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "eight per cent", the words "six per cent" had been substituted, in
respect of the amount of total turnover or gross receipts which is received by an account payee cheque or an account payee bank draft
or use of electronic clearing system through a bank account or through such other electronic mode as may be prescribed  during the
previous year or before the due date specified in sub-section (1) of section 139 in respect of that previous year.

(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.

(3) The written down value of any asset of an eligible business shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the eligible assessee had
claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant assessment years.

(4) Where an eligible assessee declares profit for any previous year in accordance with the provisions of this section and he declares
profit for any of the five assessment years relevant to the previous year succeeding such previous year not in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1), he shall not be eligible to claim the benefit of the provisions of this section for five assessment years
subsequent to the assessment year relevant to the previous year in which the profit has not been declared in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (1).

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an eligible assessee to whom the provisions of sub-
section (4) are applicable and whose total income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be
required to keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as required under sub-section (2) of section 44AA and get
them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.

(6) The provisions of this section, notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions, shall not apply to—

(i) a person carrying on profession as referred to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA;

(ii) a person earning income in the nature of commission or brokerage; or

(iii) a person carrying on any agency business.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) "eligible assessee" means,—

(i) an individual, Hindu undivided family or a partnership firm, who is a resident, but not a limited liability partnership firm as defined
under clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability Partnership Act, 2008 (6 of 2009); and

(ii) who has not claimed deduction under any of the sections 10A, 10AA, 10B, 10BA or deduction under any provisions of Chapter VIA
under the heading "C.—Deductions in respect of certain incomes" in the relevant assessment year;

(b) "eligible business" means,—

(i) any business except the business of plying, hiring or leasing goods carriages referred to in section 44AE; and

(ii) whose total turnover or gross receipts in the previous year does not exceed an amount of two crore rupees.

Following provisos shall be inserted after sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of Explanation to section 44AD by the Finance Act, 2023,
w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that where the amount or aggregate of the amounts received during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed five per cent of the
total turnover or gross receipts of such previous year, this sub-clause shall have effect as if for the words "two crore rupees", the words "three
crore rupees" had been substituted:

Provided further that for the purposes of the first proviso, the receipt of amount or aggregate of amounts by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the receipt in cash.

75

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 
75. See rule 6ABBA.
Special provision for computing profits and gains of profession on presumptive basis.

44ADA. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 28 to 43C, [in case of an assessee, being an individual or a partnership firm
other than a limited liability partnership as defined under clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability Partnership Act,
2008 (6 of 2009), who is a resident in India, and] is engaged in a profession referred to in sub-section (1) of section 44AA and whose total
gross receipts do not exceed fifty lakh rupees in a previous year, a sum equal to fifty per cent of the total gross receipts of the assessee in
the previous year on account of such profession or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid sum claimed to have been
earned by the assessee, shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such profession chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and
gains of business or profession".

Following provisos shall be inserted after sub-section (1) of section 44ADA by the Finance Act, 2023, w.e.f. 1-4-2024:

Provided that in case of an assessee where the amount or aggregate of the amounts received during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed
five per cent of the total gross receipts of such previous year, this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "fifty lakh rupees", the words
"seventy-five lakh rupees" had been substituted:

Provided further that for the purposes of the first proviso, the receipt of amount or aggregate of amounts by a cheque drawn on a bank or by
a bank draft, which is not account payee, shall be deemed to be the receipt in cash.

(2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be deemed to have been
already given full effect to and no further deduction under those sections shall be allowed.

(3) The written down value of any asset used for the purposes of profession shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the assessee
had claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant assessment years.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, an assessee who claims that his profits and gains
from the profession are lower than the profits and gains specified in sub-section (1) and whose total income exceeds the maximum
amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall be required to keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as
required under sub-section (1) of section 44AA and get them audited and furnish a report of such audit as required under section 44AB.

 
76. Substituted for "in the case of an assessee, being a resident in India, who" by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

Special provision for computing profits and gains of shipping business in the case of non-residents.

44B. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43A, in the case of an assessee, being a non-resident,
engaged in the business of operation of ships, a sum equal to seven and a half per cent of the aggregate of the amounts specified in
sub-section (2) shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of
business or profession".

(2) The amounts referred to in sub-section (1) shall be the following, namely :—

(i) the amount paid or payable (whether in or out of India) to the assessee or to any person on his behalf on account of the carriage of
passengers, livestock, mail or goods shipped at any port in India; and

(ii) the amount received or deemed to be received in India by or on behalf of the assessee on account of the carriage of passengers,
livestock, mail or goods shipped at any port outside India.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the amount referred to in clause (i) or clause (ii) shall include the amount paid or
payable or received or deemed to be received, as the case may be, by way of demurrage charges or handling charges or any other
amount of similar nature.

76

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Special provision for computing profits and gains of the business of operation of aircraft in the case of non-residents.

44BBA. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in sections 28 to 43A, in the case of an assessee, being a non-resident,
engaged in the business of operation of aircraft, a sum equal to five per cent of the aggregate of the amounts specified in sub-section (2)
shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such business chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or
profession".

(2) The amounts referred to in sub-section (1) shall be the following, namely :—

(a) the amount paid or payable (whether in or out of India) to the assessee or to any person on his behalf on account of the carriage of
passengers, livestock, mail or goods from any place in India; and

(b) the amount received or deemed to be received in India by or on behalf of the assessee on account of the carriage of passengers,
livestock, mail or goods from any place outside India.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Appearance by authorised representative.

288. (1) Any assessee who is entitled or required to attend before any income-tax authority or the Appellate Tribunal in connection with
any proceeding under this Act otherwise than when required under section 131 to attend personally for examination on oath or
affirmation, may, subject to the other provisions of this section, attend by an authorised representative.

(2) For the purposes of this section, "authorised representative" means a person authorised by the assessee in writing to appear on his
behalf, being—

 (i)  a person related to the assessee in any manner, or a person regularly employed by the assessee; or

(ii)  any officer of a Scheduled Bank with which the assessee maintains a current account or has other regular dealings; or

(iii) any legal practitioner who is entitled to practise in any civil court in India; or

(iv) an accountant; or

(v)  any person who has passed any accountancy examination recognised in this behalf by the Board ; or

(vi) any person who has acquired such educational qualifications as the Board may prescribe  for this purpose; or

any person who, before the coming into force of this Act in the Union territory of Dadra and Nagar Haveli, Goa†, Daman and Diu, or
Pondicherry, attended before an income-tax authority in the said territory on behalf of any assessee otherwise than in the capacity of an
employee or relative of that assessee; or

any other person who, immediately before the commencement of this Act, was an income-tax practitioner within the meaning of clause
(iv) of sub-section (2) of section 61 of the Indian Income-tax Act, 1922 (11 of 1922), and was actually practising as such;

any other person as may be prescribed .

Explanation.—In this section, "accountant" means a chartered accountant as defined in clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the
Chartered Accountants Act, 1949 (38 of 1949) who holds a valid certificate of practice under sub-section (1) of section 6 of that Act, but
does not include [except for the purposes of representing the assessee under sub-section (1)]—

(a)  in case of an assessee, being a company, the person who is not eligible for appointment as an auditor of the said company in
accordance with the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 141 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013); or

(b)  in any other case,—

 (i)  the assessee himself or in case of the assessee, being a firm or association of persons or Hindu undivided family, any partner of the
firm, or member of the association or the family;

 (ii)  in case of the assessee, being a trust or institution, any person referred to in clauses (a), (b), (c) and (cc) of sub-section (3) of section
13;

(iii) in case of any person other than persons referred to in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the person who is competent to verify the return under
section 139 in accordance with the provisions of section 140;

(iv)  any relative of any of the persons referred to in sub-clauses (i), (ii) and (iii);

 (v)  an officer or employee of the assessee;

(vi)  an individual who is a partner, or who is in the employment, of an officer or employee of the assessee;

(vii) an individual who, or his relative or partner—

 (I)  is holding any security of, or interest in, the assessee:

Provided that the relative may hold security or interest in the assessee of the face value not exceeding one hundred thousand rupees;

(II)  is indebted to the assessee:

Provided that the relative may be indebted to the assessee for an amount not exceeding one hundred thousand rupees;

has given a guarantee or provided any security in connection with the indebtedness of any third person to the assessee:

85

86

87

88

89

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Provided that the relative may give guarantee or provide any security in connection with the indebtedness of any third person to the
assessee for an amount not exceeding one hundred thousand rupees;

a person who, whether directly or indirectly, has business relationship with the assessee of such nature as may be prescribed ;

(ix)  a person who has been convicted by a court of an offence involving fraud and a period of ten years has not elapsed from the date of
such conviction.

(3) [***]

(4) No person—

(a)  who has been dismissed or removed from Government service after the 1st day of April, 1938; or

(b)  who has been convicted of an offence connected with any income-tax proceeding or on whom a penalty has been imposed under
this Act, other than a penalty imposed on him under clause (ii) of sub-section (1) of section 271 or clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section
272A; or

(c)  who has become an insolvent; or

(d)  who has been convicted by a court for an offence involving fraud,

shall be qualified to represent an assessee under sub-section (1), for all times in the case of a person referred to in clause (a), for such
time as the Principal Chief Commissioner or Chief Commissioner or Principal Commissioner or Commissioner may by order determine in
the case of a person referred to in clause (b), for the period during which the insolvency continues in the case of a person referred to in
clause (c), and for a period of ten years from the date of conviction in the case of a person referred to in clause (d).

(5) If any person—

(a)  who is a legal practitioner or an accountant is found guilty of misconduct in his professional capacity by any authority entitled to
institute disciplinary proceedings against him, an order passed by that authority shall have effect in relation to his right to attend before
an income-tax authority as it has in relation to his right to practise as a legal practitioner or accountant, as the case may be;

 who is not a legal practitioner or an accountant, is found guilty of misconduct in connection with any income-tax proceedings by the
prescribed authority, the prescribed authority  may direct that he shall thenceforth be disqualified to represent an assessee under sub-
section (1).

(6) Any order or direction under clause (b) of sub-section (4) or clause (b) of sub-section (5) shall be subject to the following conditions,
namely :—

(a)  no such order or direction shall be made in respect of any person unless he has been given a reasonable opportunity of being heard;

(b)  any person against whom any such order or direction is made may, within one month of the making of the order or direction, appeal
to the Board to have the order or direction cancelled; and

(c)  no such order or direction shall take effect until the expiration of one month from the making thereof, or, where an appeal has been
preferred, until the disposal of the appeal.

(7) A person disqualified to represent an assessee by virtue of the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 61 of the Indian Income-tax Act,
1922 (11 of 1922), shall be disqualified to represent an assessee under sub-section (1).

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, "relative" in relation to an individual, means—

(a)  spouse of the individual;

(b)  brother or sister of the individual;

(c)  brother or sister of the spouse of the individual;

(d)  any lineal ascendant or descendant of the individual;

(e)  any lineal ascendant or descendant of the spouse of the individual;

(f)  spouse of a person referred to in clause (b), clause (c), clause (d) or clause (e);

(g)  any lineal descendant of a brother or sister of either the individual or the spouse of the individual.

90

92

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 
85. See rules 49 to 66 and Form Nos. 38 to 40.

86. See rule 12A.

See rule 54 and Form No. 39 for application for registration as authorised income-tax practitioner and rule 55 and Form No. 40 for Form of Certificate by
Commissioner for registration of authorised representative.

87. See rule 50.

88. See rule 51.

89. See rule 51B.

†Goa has now become a State.

90. See rule 51A.

91. See rules 52 and 59 to 66.

92. The prescribed authority under rule 52 is the Chief Commissioner or Commissioner having requisite jurisdiction.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



CHAPTER XIV

PROCEDURE FOR ASSESSMENT

Return of income.

139.  (1) Every person,—

 (a) being a company or a firm; or

 (b) being a person other than a company or a firm, if his total income or the total income of any other person in respect of which he is
assessable under this Act during the previous year exceeded the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax,

shall, on or before the due date, furnish a return of his income or the income of such other person during the previous year, in the
prescribed  form and verified in the prescribed manner and setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed :

Provided that a person referred to in clause (b), who is not required to furnish a return under this sub-section and residing in such area
as may be specified by the Board in this behalf by notification in the Official Gazette, and who during the previous year incurs an
expenditure of fifty thousand rupees or more towards consumption of electricity or at any time during the previous year fulfils any one
of the following conditions, namely :—

  (i) is in occupation of an immovable property exceeding a specified floor area, whether by way of ownership, tenancy or otherwise, as
may be specified by the Board in this behalf; or

 (ii) is the owner or the lessee of a motor vehicle other than a two-wheeled motor vehicle, whether having any detachable side car having
extra wheel attached to such two-wheeled motor vehicle or not; or

(iii) [***]

(iv) has incurred expenditure for himself or any other person on travel to any foreign country; or

 (v) is the holder of a credit card, not being an "add-on" card, issued by any bank or institution; or

(vi) is a member of a club where entrance fee charged is twenty-five thousand rupees or more,

shall furnish a return, of his income during any previous year ending before the 1st day of April, 2005, on or before the due date in the
prescribed form and verified in the prescribed manner and setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed :

Provided further that the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify the class or classes of persons to
whom the provisions of the first proviso shall not apply :

Provided also that every company or a firm shall furnish on or before the due date the return in respect of its income or loss in every
previous year :

Provided also that a person, being a resident other than not ordinarily resident in India within the meaning of clause (6) of section 6,
who is not required to furnish a return under this sub-section and who at any time during the previous year,—

 (a) holds, as a beneficial owner or otherwise, any asset (including any financial interest in any entity) located outside India or has signing
authority in any account located outside India; or

 (b) is a beneficiary of any asset (including any financial interest in any entity) located outside India,

shall furnish, on or before the due date, a return in respect of his income or loss for the previous year in such form and verified in such
manner and setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed:

Provided also that nothing contained in the fourth proviso shall apply to an individual, being a beneficiary of any asset (including any
financial interest in any entity) located outside India where, income, if any, arising from such asset is includible in the income of the
person referred to in clause (a) of that proviso in accordance with the provisions of this Act:

Provided also that every person, being an individual or a Hindu undivided family or an association of persons or a body of individuals,
whether incorporated or not, or an artificial juridical person, if his total income or the total income of any other person in respect of
which he is assessable under this Act during the previous year, without giving effect to the provisions of clause (38) of section 10 or
section 10A or section 10B or section 10BA or section 54 or section 54B or section 54D or section 54EC or section 54F or section 54G or

49

50

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



section 54GA or section 54GB or Chapter VI-A exceeded the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, shall, on or before
the due date, furnish a return of his income or the income of such other person during the previous year, in the prescribed form and
verified in the prescribed manner and setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed:

Provided also that a person referred to in clause (b), who is not required to furnish a return under this sub-section, and who during the
previous year—

 (i) has deposited an amount or aggregate of the amounts exceeding one crore rupees in one or more current accounts maintained with
a banking company or a co-operative bank; or

(ii) has incurred expenditure of an amount or aggregate of the amounts exceeding two lakh rupees for himself or any other person for
travel to a foreign country; or

(iii) has incurred expenditure of an amount or aggregate of the amounts exceeding one lakh rupees towards consumption of electricity;
or

(iv) fulfils such other conditions as may be prescribed ,

shall furnish a return of his income on or before the due date in such form and verified in such manner and setting forth such other
particulars, as may be prescribed.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expression "motor vehicle" shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (28)
of section 2 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (59 of 1988).

Explanation 2.—In this sub-section, "due date" means,—

 (a) where the assessee other than an assessee referred to in clause (aa) is—

   (i) a company; or

  (ii) a person (other than a company) whose accounts are required to be audited under this Act or under any other law for the time being
in force; or

  (iii) a partner of a firm whose accounts are required to be audited under this Act or under any other law for the time being in force [or
the spouse of such partner if the provisions of section 5A applies to such spouse],

the 31st day of October of the assessment year;

in the case of an assessee [, including the partners of the firm or the spouse of such partner (if the provisions of section 5A applies to
such spouse), being such assessee,] who is required to furnish a report referred to in section 92E, the 30th day of November of the
assessment year;

 (b) in the case of a person other than a company, referred to in the first proviso to this sub-section, the 31st day of October of the
assessment year;

 (c) in the case of any other assessee, the 31st day of July of the assessment year.

Explanation 3.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expression "travel to any foreign country" does not include travel to the
neighbouring countries or to such places of pilgrimage as the Board may specify in this behalf by notification in the Official Gazette.

Explanation 4.—For the purposes of this section "beneficial owner" in respect of an asset means an individual who has provided, directly
or indirectly, consideration for the asset for the immediate or future benefit, direct or indirect, of himself or any other person.

Explanation 5.—For the purposes of this section "beneficiary" in respect of an asset means an individual who derives benefit from the
asset during the previous year and the consideration for such asset has been provided by any person other than such beneficiary.

Explanation 6.—For the purposes of this sub-section,—

 (a) "banking company" shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (i) of the Explanation to section 269SS;

 (b) "co-operative bank" shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (ii) of the Explanation to section 269SS.

(1A) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (1), any person, being an individual who is in receipt of income chargeable under
the head "Salaries" may, at his option, furnish a return of his income for any previous year to his employer, in accordance with such
scheme as may be specified by the Board in this behalf, by notification in the Official Gazette, and subject to such conditions as may be

51

52

52

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



specified therein, and such employer shall furnish all returns of income received by him on or before the due date, in such form
(including on a floppy, diskette, magnetic cartridge tape, CD-ROM or any other computer readable media) and manner as may be
specified in that scheme, and in such case, any employee who has filed a return of his income to his employer shall be deemed to have
furnished a return of income under sub-section (1), and the provisions of this Act shall apply accordingly.

(1B) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (1), any person, being a company or being a person other than a company,
required to furnish a return of income under sub-section (1), may, at his option, on or before the due date, furnish a return of his income
for any previous year in accordance with such scheme as may be specified by the Board in this behalf by notification in the Official
Gazette and subject to such conditions as may be specified therein, in such form (including on a floppy, diskette, magnetic cartridge
tape, CD-ROM or any other computer readable media) and in the manner as may be specified in that scheme, and in such case, the
return of income furnished under such scheme shall be deemed to be a return furnished under sub-section (1), and the provisions of this
Act shall apply accordingly.

(1C) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, exempt
any class or classes of persons from the requirement of furnishing a return of income having regard to such conditions as may be
specified in that notification.

(3) If any person who has sustained a loss in any previous year under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" or under the
head "Capital gains" and claims that the loss or any part thereof should be carried forward under sub-section (1) of section 72, or sub-
section (2) of section 73, or sub-section (2) of section 73A or sub-section (1) or sub-section (3) of section 74, or sub-section (3) of section
74A, he may furnish, within the time allowed under sub-section (1), a return of loss in the prescribed form  and verified in the
prescribed manner and containing such other particulars as may be prescribed, and all the provisions of this Act shall apply as if it were
a return under sub-section (1).

(4) Any person who has not furnished a return within the time allowed to him under sub-section (1), may furnish the [return for any
previous year at any time before three months prior to] the end of the relevant assessment year or before the completion of the
assessment, whichever is earlier.

(4A) Every person in receipt of income derived from property held under trust or other legal obligation wholly for charitable or
religious purposes or in part only for such purposes, or of income being voluntary contributions referred to in sub-clause (iia) of clause
(24) of section 2, shall, if the total income in respect of which he is assessable as a representative assessee (the total income for this
purpose being computed under this Act without giving effect to the provisions of sections 11 and 12) exceeds the maximum amount
which is not chargeable to income-tax, furnish a return of such income of the previous year in the prescribed form and verified in the
prescribed manner and setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed and all the provisions of this Act shall, so far as may be,
apply as if it were a return required to be furnished under sub-section (1).

(4B) The chief executive officer (whether such chief executive officer is known as Secretary or by any other designation) of every
political party shall, if the total income in respect of which the political party is assessable (the total income for this purpose being
computed under this Act without giving effect to the provisions of section 13A) exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to
income-tax, furnish a return of such income of the previous year in the prescribed form and verified in the prescribed manner and
setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed and all the provisions of this Act, shall, so far as may be, apply as if it were a
return required to be furnished under sub-section (1).

(4C) Every—

 (a) research association referred to in clause (21) of section 10;

 (b) news agency referred to in clause (22B) of section 10;

 (c) association or institution referred to in clause (23A) of section 10;

person referred to in clause (23AAA) of section 10;

 (d) institution referred to in clause (23B) of section 10;

 (e) fund or institution referred to in sub-clause (iv) or trust or institution referred to in sub-clause (v) or any university or other
educational institution referred to in sub-clause (iiiab) or sub-clause (iiiad) or sub-clause (vi) or any hospital or other medical institution
referred to in sub-clause (iiiac) or sub-clause (iiiae) or sub-clause (via) of clause (23C) of section 10;

(ea) Mutual Fund referred to in clause (23D) of section 10;

(eb) securitisation trust referred to in clause (23DA) of section 10;

53

54

55

55

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



) Investor Protection Fund referred to in clause (23EC) or clause (23ED) of section 10;

) Core Settlement Guarantee Fund referred to in clause (23EE) of section 10;

(ec) venture capital company or venture capital fund referred to in clause (23FB) of section 10;

 (f) trade union referred to in sub-clause (a) or association referred to in sub-clause (b) of clause (24) of section 10;

Board or Authority referred to in clause (29A) of section 10;

 (g) body or authority or Board or Trust or Commission (by whatever name called) referred to in clause (46) of section 10;

 (h) infrastructure debt fund referred to in clause (47) of section 10,

shall, if the total income in respect of which such research association, news agency, association or institution, person or fund or trust or
university or other educational institution or any hospital or other medical institution or trade union or body or authority or Board or
Trust or Commission or infrastructure debt fund or Mutual Fund or securitisation trust or venture capital company or venture capital
fund is assessable, without giving effect to the provisions of section 10, exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to
income-tax, furnish a return of such income of the previous year in the prescribed form  and verified in the prescribed manner and
setting forth such other particulars as may be prescribed and all the provisions of this Act shall, so far as may be, apply as if it were a
return required to be furnished under sub-section (1).

(4D) Every university, college or other institution referred to in clause (ii) and clause (iii) of sub-section (1) of section 35, which is not
required to furnish return of income or loss under any other provision of this section, shall furnish the return in respect of its income or
loss in every previous year and all the provisions of this Act shall, so far as may be, apply as if it were a return required to be furnished
under sub-section (1).

(4E) Every business trust, which is not required to furnish return of income or loss under any other provisions of this section, shall
furnish the return of its income in respect of its income or loss in every previous year and all the provisions of this Act shall, so far as may
be, apply* if it were a return required to be furnished under sub-section (1).

(4F) Every investment fund referred to in section 115UB, which is not required to furnish return of income or loss under any other
provisions of this section, shall furnish the return of income in respect of its income or loss in every previous year and all the provisions
of this Act shall, so far as may be, apply as if it were a return required to be furnished under sub-section (1).

(5) If any person, having furnished a return under sub-section (1) or sub-section (4), discovers any omission or any wrong statement
therein, he may furnish a revised return at any time [before three months prior to the end] of the relevant assessment year or before
the completion of the assessment, whichever is earlier.

(6) The prescribed form of the returns referred to in sub-sections (1) and (3) of this section, and in clause (i) of sub-section (1) of section
142 shall, in such cases as may be prescribed, require the assessee to furnish the particulars of income exempt from tax, assets of the
prescribed nature and value, held by him as a beneficial owner or otherwise or in which he is a beneficiary, his bank account and credit
card held by him, expenditure exceeding the prescribed limits incurred by him under prescribed heads and such other outgoings as may
be prescribed.

(6A) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (6), the prescribed form of the returns referred to in this section, and in clause (i)
of sub-section (1) of section 142 shall, in the case of an assessee engaged in any business or profession, also require him to furnish the
report of any audit referred to in section 44AB, or, where the report has been furnished prior to the furnishing of the return, a copy of
such report together with proof of furnishing the report, the particulars of the location and style of the principal place where he carries
on the business or profession and all the branches thereof, the names and addresses of his partners, if any, in such business or
profession and, if he is a member of an association or body of individuals, the names of the other members of the association or the
body of individuals and the extent of the share of the assessee and the shares of all such partners or the members, as the case may be,
in the profits of the business or profession and any branches thereof.

(7) [***]

(8)(a) Where the return under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) or sub-section (4) for an assessment year is furnished after the
specified date, or is not furnished, then [whether or not the Assessing Officer has extended the date for furnishing the return under sub-
section (1) or sub-section (2)], the assessee shall be liable to pay simple interest at fifteen per cent per annum, reckoned from the day
immediately following the specified date to the date of the furnishing of the return or, where no return has been furnished, the date of
completion of the assessment under section 144, on the amount of the tax payable on the total income as determined on regular
assessment, as reduced by the advance tax, if any, paid, and any tax deducted at source :

56

57

58

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Provided that the Assessing Officer may, in such cases and under such circumstances as may be prescribed , reduce or waive the
interest payable by any assessee under this sub-section.

Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this sub-section, "specified date", in relation to a return for an assessment year, means,—

 (a) in the case of every assessee whose total income, or the total income of any person in respect of which he is assessable under this
Act, includes any income from business or profession, the date of the expiry of four months from the end of the previous year or where
there is more than one previous year, from the end of the previous year which expired last before the commencement of the assessment
year or the 30th day of June of the assessment year, whichever is later;

 (b) in the case of every other assessee, the 30th day of June of the assessment year.

Explanation 2.—Where, in relation to an assessment year, an assessment is made for the first time under section 147, the assessment so
made shall be regarded as a regular assessment for the purposes of this sub-section.

(b) Where as a result of an order under section 147 or section 154 or section 155 or section 250 or section 254 or section 260 or section
262 or section 263 or section 264 or an order of the Settlement Commission under sub-section (4) of section 245D, the amount of tax on
which interest was payable under this sub-section has been increased or reduced, as the case may be, the interest shall be increased or
reduced accordingly, and—

  (i) in a case where the interest is increased, the Assessing Officer shall serve on the assessee, a notice of demand in the prescribed form
specifying the sum payable, and such notice of demand shall be deemed to be a notice under section 156 and the provisions of this Act
shall apply accordingly;

 (ii) in a case where the interest is reduced, the excess interest paid, if any, shall be refunded.

(c) The provisions of this sub-section shall apply in respect of the assessment for the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of
April, 1988, or any earlier assessment year, and references therein to the other provisions of this Act shall be construed as references to
the said provisions as they were applicable to the relevant assessment year.

[(8A) Any person, whether or not he has furnished a return under sub-section (1) or sub-section (4) or sub-section (5), for an
assessment year (herein referred to as the relevant assessment year), may furnish an updated return of his income or the income of any
other person in respect of which he is assessable under this Act, for the previous year relevant to such assessment year, in the prescribed
form , verified in such manner and setting forth such particulars as may be prescribed, at any time within twenty-four months from the
end of the relevant assessment year:

Provided that the provision of this sub-section shall not apply, if the updated return,—

 (a) is a return of a loss; or

 (b) has the effect of decreasing the total tax liability determined on the basis of return furnished under sub-section (1) or sub-section (4)
or sub-section (5); or

 (c) results in refund or increases the refund due on the basis of return furnished under sub-section (1) or sub-section (4) or sub-section
(5),

of such person under this Act for the relevant assessment year:

Provided further that a person shall not be eligible to furnish an updated return under this sub-section, where—

 (a) a search has been initiated under section 132 or books of account or other documents or any assets are requisitioned under section
132A in the case of such person; or

 (b) a survey has been conducted under section 133A, other than sub-section (2A) of that section, in the case of such person; or

 (c) a notice has been issued to the effect that any money, bullion, jewellery or valuable article or thing, seized or requisitioned under
section 132 or section 132A in the case of any other person belongs to such person; or

 (d) a notice has been issued to the effect that any books of account or documents, seized or requisitioned under section 132 or section
132A in the case of any other person, pertain or pertains to, or any other information contained therein, relate to, such person,

for the assessment year relevant to the previous year in which such search is initiated or survey is conducted or requisition is made and
any assessment year preceding such assessment year:

59

60

61

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



Provided also that no updated return shall be furnished by any person for the relevant assessment year, where—

 (a) an updated return has been furnished by him under this sub-section for the relevant assessment year; or

 (b) any proceeding for assessment or reassessment or recomputation or revision of income under this Act is pending or has been
completed for the relevant assessment year in his case; or

 (c) the Assessing Officer has information in respect of such person for the relevant assessment year in his possession under the
Smugglers and Foreign Exchange Manipulators (Forfeiture of Property) Act, 1976 (13 of 1976) or the Prohibition of Benami Property
Transactions Act, 1988 (45 of 1988) or the Prevention of Money-laundering Act, 2002 (15 of 2003) or the Black Money (Undisclosed
Foreign Income and Assets) and Imposition of Tax Act, 2015 (22 of 2015) and the same has been communicated to him, prior to the date
of furnishing of return under this sub-section; or

 (d) information for the relevant assessment year has been received under an agreement referred to in section 90 or section 90A in
respect of such person and the same has been communicated to him, prior to the date of furnishing of return under this sub-section; or

 (e) any prosecution proceedings under the Chapter XXII have been initiated for the relevant assessment year in respect of such person,
prior to the date of furnishing of return under this sub-section; or

 (f) he is such person or belongs to such class of persons, as may be notified by the Board in this regard:

Provided also that if any person has sustained a loss in any previous year and has furnished a return of loss in the prescribed form
within the time allowed under sub-section (1) and verified in the prescribed manner and containing such other particulars as may be
prescribed, he shall be allowed to furnish an updated return where such updated return is a return of income:

Provided also that if the loss or any part thereof carried forward under Chapter VI or unabsorbed depreciation carried forward under
sub-section (2) of section 32 or tax credit carried forward under section 115JAA or under section 115JD is to be reduced for any
subsequent previous year as a result of furnishing of return of income under this sub-section for a previous year, an updated return shall
be furnished for each such subsequent previous year.]

(9) Where the Assessing Officer considers that the return of income furnished by the assessee is defective, he may intimate the defect to
the assessee and give him an opportunity to rectify the defect within a period of fifteen days from the date of such intimation or within
such further period which, on an application made in this behalf, the Assessing Officer may, in his discretion, allow; and if the defect is
not rectified within the said period of fifteen days or, as the case may be, the further period so allowed, then, notwithstanding anything
contained in any other provision of this Act, the return shall be treated as an invalid return and the provisions of this Act shall apply as if
the assessee had failed to furnish the return :

Provided that where the assessee rectifies the defect after the expiry of the said period of fifteen days or the further period allowed, but
before the assessment is made, the Assessing Officer may condone the delay and treat the return as a valid return.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, a return of income shall be regarded as defective unless all the following conditions
are fulfilled, namely :—

) the annexures, statements and columns in the return of income relating to computation of income chargeable under each head of
income, computation of gross total income and total income have been duly filled in;

(aa) [***]

) the return is accompanied by a statement showing the computation of the tax payable on the basis of the return;

(bb) the return is accompanied by the report of the audit referred to in section 44AB, or, where the report has been furnished prior
to the furnishing of the return, by a copy of such report together with proof of furnishing the report;

 (c) the return is accompanied by proof of—

  (i) the tax, if any, claimed to have been deducted or collected at source and the advance tax and tax on self-assessment, if any, claimed
to have been paid :

Provided that where the return is not accompanied by proof of the tax, if any, claimed to have been deducted or collected at source, the
return of income shall not be regarded as defective if—

 (a) a certificate for tax deducted or collected was not furnished under section 203 or section 206C to the person furnishing his return of
income;

62-63

62-63

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



 (b) such certificate is produced within a period of two years specified under sub-section (14) of section 155;

 (ii) the amount of compulsory deposit, if any, claimed to have been made under the Compulsory Deposit Scheme (Income-tax Payers)
Act, 1974 (38 of 1974*);

) the return is accompanied by the proof of payment of tax as required under section 140B, if the return of income is a return furnished
under sub-section (8A);]

  (d) where regular books of account are maintained by the assessee, the return is accompanied by copies of—

  (i) manufacturing account, trading account, profit and loss account or, as the case may be, income and expenditure account or any
other similar account and balance sheet;

 (ii) in the case of a proprietary business or profession, the personal account of the proprietor; in the case of a firm, association of
persons or body of individuals, personal accounts of the partners or members; and in the case of a partner or member of a firm,
association of persons or body of individuals, also his personal account in the firm, association of persons or body of individuals;

  (e) where the accounts of the assessee have been audited, the return is accompanied by copies of the audited profit and loss account
and balance sheet and the auditor's report and, where an audit of cost accounts of the assessee has been conducted, under section
233B  of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956), also the report under that section;

 (f) where regular books of account are not maintained by the assessee, the return is accompanied by a statement indicating the
amounts of turnover or, as the case may be, gross receipts, gross profit, expenses and net profit of the business or profession and the
basis on which such amounts have been computed, and also disclosing the amounts of total sundry debtors, sundry creditors, stock-in-
trade and cash balance as at the end of the previous year:

[Provided that the Board may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify that any of the conditions specified in clauses (a) to (f) to
the Explanation shall not apply to such class of assessees or shall apply with such modifications, as may be specified in such notification.]

(10) [Omitted by the Finance (No. 2) Act, 1991, w.e.f. 1-4-1991.]

 

65

66

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India



49. See rules 12 and 131.

50. See rule 12.

51. See rule 12AB.

52. Inserted by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

53. See rule 12.

54. Substituted for "return for any previous year at any time before" by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

55. See rule 12.

56. See rule 12.

57. Substituted for "before the end" by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

58. See rule 119A.

*Word "as" shall be inserted after the word "apply".

59. See rule 117A.

60. Inserted by the Finance Act, 2022, w.e.f. 1-4-2022.

61. See rule 12AC and ITR-U.

62-63. Rule 12 now provides that the return of income shall not be accompanied by any document or copy of any account or form or report of audit required to
be attached with return of income under any of the provisions of the Act.

64. Inserted by the Finance Act, 2022, w.e.f. 1-4-2022.

*Now repealed.

65. Now section 148 of the Companies Act, 2013.

66. Inserted by the Finance Act, 2021, w.e.f. 1-4-2021.

Income Tax Department
Ministry of Finance, Government of India


